
From: Cool, Richard
To: Sonia Slayden
Cc: Johnson, Patrick
Subject: RE: Financial Documentation for Chill Transportation, LLC Inability-to-Pay Claim
Date: Saturday, July 23, 2022 12:26:22 PM

Hi Sonia: 

Yes, I received two emails from you on Thursday evening in that approximate 7:30-7:46 p.m.
time period.  One email included your Q2 2022 tax payment invoice and the other email
included some typed responses on the EPA’s ATP form. 

I am in the process of reviewing your typed ATP form responses and will respond with some
comments hopefully later today. 

I know that you are working hard to complete your responses and I appreciate your efforts. 

You have a good weekend too and I hope you are feeling better.  Please look for my more
substantive response later today. 

Thank you.

Rick

From: Sonia Slayden <chilltransportation1@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, July 22, 2022 6:53 PM
To: Cool, Richard <Cool.Richard@epa.gov>
Subject: Re: Financial Documentation for Chill Transportation, LLC Inability-to-Pay Claim

Rick I sent you a few things last night did you receive them? If not please let me know.   Thank you
i’m doing everything I can. You have a good weekend. 

On Tue, Jul 19, 2022 at 8:18 AM Cool, Richard <Cool.Richard@epa.gov> wrote:

Sounds good Sonia.  Hope to hear from you again later today. 
 
Take care.
 
Rick
 

From: Sonia Slayden <chilltransportation1@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 8:16 AM
To: Cool, Richard <Cool.Richard@epa.gov>
Subject: Re: Financial Documentation for Chill Transportation, LLC Inability-to-Pay Claim
 
Ok will do.  but will send you something later this afternoon.
Thank you 
 
On Tue, Jul 19, 2022 at 8:11 AM Cool, Richard <Cool.Richard@epa.gov> wrote:



Hi Sonia:
 
Thank you for your response. 
 
I just sent you a GoAnywhere file request email where you can upload documents.  If you
want to experiment with it, try to send me a couple of documents and we will see if you
can make it work on your end and I get them.
 
If this GoAnywhere system doesn’t work or it is just too complicated, I am always OK
with multiple emails with your attachments so be patient as we can make it work one way
or the other.
 
Thanks again for your cooperation.  We appreciate your efforts.
 
Rick Cool
Surface Water Enforcement Section
U.S. EPA Region 10
1200 Sixth Avenue, Ste. 155, M/S 20-C04
Seattle, WA  98101
 
cool.richard@epa.gov
Phone: (206) 553-6223
Cell:  (206) 321-5396
 

From: Sonia Slayden <chilltransportation1@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 8:02 AM
To: Cool, Richard <Cool.Richard@epa.gov>
Subject: Re: Financial Documentation for Chill Transportation, LLC Inability-to-Pay Claim
 
Hi Richard thank you for your help. sure please proceed. I’ve never worked with the program
for-mentioned but I’ll give it a go.  Im working on it today. It got a bit complicated for me
yesterday. I will send you what I can today. Thanks for your help
 
On Tue, Jul 19, 2022 at 7:24 AM Cool, Richard <Cool.Richard@epa.gov> wrote:

Hello Sonia:
 
I hope this Tuesday email finds all things going OK for you and that you had a safe and
restful weekend.
 
Per our call last Friday, July 15, you seemed to have had the energy and intentions (my
perception) on Friday to continue your efforts to submit responses and supporting
documentation as part of Chill’s overall responses to the official EPA Ability-To-Pay
(ATP) claim form, including your intention to submit photographs of your written
responses. 
 
I have not received any emails or more documentation since our Friday call, thus this
inquiry on what up.
 



I was just checking in to see how that process was going and when EPA might expect
the additional Chill  submissions including the photographed responses.
 
Thank you for any response to this email.  If you need any help in making your
submissions, please let me know and I will do what I can to assist and make that
process easier. 
 
For example, I have the ability to send you a GoAnywhere file transfer email where
you might be able to upload all of the photographs at one time as means to avoid
multiple emails with singular attachments.  Let me know if you want to attempt to use
the GoAnywhere option and I can send you that email for your trial run.
 
Best regards,
 
Rick Cool
Surface Water Enforcement Section
U.S. EPA Region 10
1200 Sixth Avenue, Ste. 155, M/S 20-C04
Seattle, WA  98101
 
cool.richard@epa.gov
Phone: (206) 553-6223
Cell:  (206) 321-5396
 
 




